
Foundation Stage Medium term plan for Summer 1 – Growing (Physical focus) 

 

Week 1 2 3 4 5 6 

Topic Seeds Plants Vegetables Fruit  Caterpillars & Butterflies Tadpoles & Frogs  

Personal, Social  
and Emotional 

 

Caring for plants – rules and 
team work 
Recap Golden Rules 
SCARF  - Growing and 
Changing - Seasons 

 
 
SCARF  - Growing and 
Changing – Where do 
babies come from? 

Healthy diet 
 
SCARF  - Growing and 
Changing – Getting bigger 

  
 
SCARF  - Growing and 
Changing – Me and my 
body , girls and boys 

Caring for creatures in our 
environment 
SCARF  - Growing and 
Changing – Life Stages 

Ambitions – when I grow up 
 
SCARF  -  
Growing and Changing – 
Human Life Stages 

Physical 
 
 

Handling gardening tools 
and seeds.  

Movement based on Tiny 
Seed 

Coach Jack Ball skills and 
team games 

Jack and Beanstalk 
movement 
 
 
 

Handling tools – knives, 
peelers, zesters, juicers. 
 

 
 

Caterpillar and butterfly 
yoga 

Handling tools – nets. 
 Frog dance/yoga 
 
 

Communication and 
Language 

 
Literacy 

 
 
 

The Tiny Seed  
 
writing labels & captions 
 
LW Phase 4 CVCC n & m 
blends 
Handwriting numbers 1,2 

 Jack and the Beanstalk 
Bean seed diaries  
 

CVCC t blends 

3,4 

Non-fiction  Cool Food 

Instructions for pizzas 

 
CVCC l blends 
5,6 

Healthy wolf & Fruit 
poems 
Scaffolded fruit poem. 
 CCVC r blends 

 
7,8 

Hungry Caterpillar 

 Days of week diaries  

 
CCVC l blends 
 9,10 

Over in the Meadow 
 What I can do/what I  
want to be when I’m grown 
 up books. 
CCVC s blends 
11,12 

Mathematical 
 
 
 
 
 
 

White Rose EYFS 
To 20 and Beyond week 1 

White Rose EYFS 
To 20 and Beyond week 2 

White Rose EYFS 
To 20 and Beyond week 3 

White Rose EYFS 
First, Then, Now week 1 

White Rose EYFS 
First, Then, Now week 2 

White Rose EYFS 
First, Then, Now week 3 

Understanding the World Planting sunflower & 
pumpkin seeds 
Factors for growth 
Observing seeds with hand 
lenses 
St George’s Day (23rd) 
 

Planting beans/diaries 
Caring for plants/needs 
Parts of plant 
 

Using senses to investigate 
vegetables Recognise/name 
common veg. 
Eatwell plate. 
 

Using senses to investigate 
fruit. Recognise/name 
common fruit. 
 

Collecting, caring for and 
observing caterpillars 

 

Simple life cycle..  

 

Life cycles of frog and  

humans 

Pond life. 
 

Expressive Arts and 
Design 

 
 
 
 

Spring songs and  
Music  
Baby Nursery role play & 
999 emergency land outside 
Clay sunflowers. 
Van Gogh sunflower 
painting. 
 

Jack and beanstalk small 
play/role play/make 
scenery for stage 

Green grocers inside  
Vegetable printing & colour 
mix painting 
Vegetable pizzas 
 

Making fruit salad and 
 juice drink smoothies 
Fruit pastels 
 
 
Healthy Eating café outside 
 

Clay model caterpillars. 
Summer songs and music  
Butterfly printing 
Science lab/minibeasts role 
play set up/play 
  

Colour mixing – greens –  

tonal scale (powder) 

Frog paintings 
 
 
Clay frogs 
 


